City of Avondale

IFB PW 15-016 Water Treatment Chemicals
Bid Opening Date: January 22, 2015

Multiple Award-- Line Item by Line Item Award

UNIVAR USA, INC HILL BROTHERS CHEMICAL CO. DPC ENTERPRISES L.P. PVS TECHNOLOGIES ~ PENNCO INC. = ARIZONA “F2 INDUSTRIES
Annual Extended =
Item Product Description Quantity Unit Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price | Unit Price | Extended Price Unit Price | Extended Price | Unit Price Price
1|Bulk 38-40% Sodium Bisulfite 110,000|Gallons 1.5930 5 175,230.00 1.6700| $ 183,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid e = z =
Bulk 33% Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda =
2solution)® 7,500|Gallons 1.3500 § 10,125.00 1.5700 $ 11,775.00 1.3460 $ 10,095.00 | No Bid No Bid
3|Bulk 20% Hydrochloric Acid* 1,000|Gallons No Bid Mo Bid 3.0800| $ 3,080.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Bulk 12% Sodium Hypochlorite (Liquid ==
4|Bleach) 350,000|Gallons 0.9530| % 333,550.00 0.8550| $ 299,250.00 0.8380| & 293,300.00 No Bid No Bid ~ Non-Responsive
5 |Bulk 35% Ferric Chloride™ 60,000|Gallons No.Bid No Bid 2.0000| 5 120,000.00 No Bid No Bid 20500/ 5 123,000.00 Mo Bid I Mo Bid
6| Bulk 65-90% Chlorine Granular Calcium™ 200|Tens Ne Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid ‘ No Bid No Bid No Bid
7|Bulk 25% Sodium Hydroxide 12,000|Gallons 1.0300| § 12,360.00 1.5700| § 18,840.00 1.0090| § 12,108.00 | MNoBid No Bid No Bid Mo Bid
8|Bulk 35% Ferric Chloride 2,700|Gallons No Bid Mo Bid 2,3300| S 6,291.00 | No Bid No Bid 43000/ 5 11,610.00 No Bid No Bid
Submittal Requirements
Bid Offer Sheet-Signed ~ Yes Yes Yes _Yes | Yes
Bundle Bid or Line |[tem Line ltem Line ltem Line Item Line ltem Line Item
Complete IFB . Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Price Sheet Yes Yes Yes Yes -~ Incomplete—
License Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Complete References Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Vendor Specified Minimum Per Order Quantity None None None Item 8 —[ 800 GL Items 5 &8 | 4,000 GL
\Prlmarv Award Low Bidder _‘
{_Secc_m_darv Award {Runner Up)
* Chemicals not being used in water reclamation processes at time of award.
Completed By: % 'li " )
y Ax Y g e
(AT A4V N8 VW, x—}) L—JI 2015
PW 15-016

Water Treatment Chemicals {Revised 2/5/2015)

lofl



