City of Avondale

IFB PW 14-038 Brine Waste Hauling-Disposal Services

Bid Opening Date: September 11, 2014

Clean Harbors

Chemical Transportation

MP Environmental

Salt River Extraction

Est. Quantity Unit Unit Extended Unit
Description (Gallons) Unit Price | Extended Price | Price | Extended Price Price Price Price | Extended Price
Brine Waste Solution Removal, Transport, Disposal 550,000] ¢ 055 |% 302,500.00 | $0.23 | § 126,500.00 | $0.209 | $114,950.00 S 017 | S 93,500.00
Arsenic Sludge Removal, Transport, Disposal 50,0000 & 098 S 49,000.00 | $0.22 | S 11,000.00 | $0.209 | $ 10,450.00 | $ 0.17 | § 8,500.00
TOTAL BASE BID|| 1.53 |'$ 351,500.00 | $0.45 | 5 137,500.00 $0.418 | $125,400.00 | 5 0.34 | 5 102,000.00
Unit Unit Extended Unit
Additional Costs Est. Quantity | Unit Price | Extended Price | Price | Extended Price Price Price Price | Extended Price
Fuel Surcharge (Gallons) 600,000f No bid No bid No hid No bid No Bid No bid 50.014 | S 8,400.00
Tank Wash 116] $225.00 $26,100.000 | No Bid No bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid |
Demurrage (Hour) TBD 598.00 TBD| No Bid No bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid
Weekend/Holiday Service Surcharge TBD 50% TBD| No Bid No bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid
GRAND TOTAL $ 377,600.00 $  137,500.00 ) $125,400.00 $ 110,400.00
Submittal Regquirements
Signed Offer Sheet Yes Yes Yes Yes
Licenses Yes Yes Yes Yes
Substitution Requests Yes Yes Yes Yes |

Key Personnel Yes Yes Yes Yes

References Yes Yes Yes Yes

Complete Bid Sheet . Yes Yes Yes Yes

Complete Addendum Yes Yes Yes Yes

Completed by: Loretta Browning
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